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If Children Guess At Words When Learning To Read, What Should We Do About It? 
W. Dorsey Hammond, Ph.D. 

 
It appears from social media and podcasts addressing issues of literacy that guessing has no place in the 
process of learning to read. For example, Nikolas (2021) sees guessing as a “serious problem in learning 
to read.” In her blog, Miss Mary (2021) presents a series of lessons or protocols of how to exEnguish any 
guessing tendencies of young readers. Kucera (2022) refers to guessing as, “…the enemy of good 
reading.” Other websites take a similar posiEon. The conclusion one might reach is that any semblance 
of guessing is a bad behavior that needs to be discouraged and ulEmately exEnguished. And yet careful 
observaEons of emerging readers, as well as mature readers, indicate a form of guessing or anEcipaEon 
as they read print. 
 
Two caveats are in order. First, we are not talking about wild guessing, but rather thoughLul responses 
based on available evidence. Secondly, we might subsEtute the more accurate words hypothesizing, 
specula2ng, inferring, or predic2ng for the more casual, informal term, guessing.  
 
Even some academicians seem confused about this issue of guessing as it relates to reading. For 
example, Seidenberg (2017) writes the following: 

Beginning readers can o7en predict the words in texts that have pictures. They can 
also predict the words in books they have read enough 2mes to memorize, as o7en 
happens in whole language classrooms… (p268) 

 
The statement above is misleading. Goodman & Burke (1972) assessed children’s reading with the 
Reading Miscue Inventory—an instrument that acknowledges predicEons as part of the reading process. 
But the researchers state very specifically that the selecEon to be read by the student, “must be enErely 
new—something he/she has never seen before. All familiar tales which the child knows in some oral 
version or as a listener should be excluded as well” (p 20). Although not stated explicitly, none of the 
examples of texts used by Goodman and Burke in thousands of administered Inventories contain 
pictures. When using the Reading Miscue Inventory, they and others have always focused enErely on the 
children’s abiliEes to process the words in non-illustrated texts they have not seen before. 
 
Under these condiEons of no pictures or previous reading or listening to the given text, both skilled and 
struggling readers o\en predict words and/or phrases. PredicEon, of course, is a form of guessing. It is 
an inevitable manifestaEon of reading connected discourse when readers are focused on making sense 
of what they are reading.  
 
This brings us to the heart of the issue. The use of meaning and language informaEon along with 
phoneEc informaEon enhances the probability of correct idenEficaEon of words and phrases. So, when 
emerging readers think about what they are reading and a^empt to make sense of the text, their use of 
phonics becomes even more effecEve, and they read more successfully. Their greater success leads early 
readers to read more, and the more texts they read, the be^er readers they become.  
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Even a^empts to recognize words in isolaEon o\en involve tentaEve responses that can be considered a 
form of guessing. For example, in the word said/sed/ the beginning s is phoneEcally regular as is the 
ending d. The medial part of the word s&&d is less so. The young reader, applying his/her phonics 
knowledge of the digraph ai, would very likely arrive at a pronunciaEon with the long a sound, as in the 
words, maid, paid, and laid.  
 
The child may iniEally pronounce the word as “sayd,” reject this pronunciaEon because it doesn’t sound 
like a familiar word, and conclude “Oh maybe that’s sed.” This tentaEve response is a form of guessing. If 
the word is presented in context, as in the sentence, I want to go too,” s&&d Sam, the probability of an 
accurate guess is increased if the child is a^ending to meaning and is not merely a^empEng to 
pronounce words. Consequently, it is a mystery why some are so uncomfortable with having young 
readers iniEally encounter words in context. (See Harrison’s 2023 interview of E. Hanford and Shanahan, 
2019.) Using the context, which is marked by a focus on meaning, is likely to enhance word recogniEon 
accuracy rather than reduce it.  
 
It is important to recognize that the word said looks phoneEcally regular and easy to recognize to a 
person who already reads, but it is not so clear to the novice reader. In other words, phonics, though 
important, gets the young reader only so far. 
  
Some would make the case that the word said should be taught as a sight word. What that means, 
essenEally, is that the teacher simply tells the child what the word is and presents it o\en enough that 
the child remembers it and does not have to sound it out when seeing it again. But wouldn’t it be be^er 
for young learners to use their thinking ability to discover or figure the word out rather than passively 
waiEng to be taught the word by rote? In addiEon, how many of these types of words can be taught as a 
sight word? What about words such as eye or eyes, aisle, sign, where, etc.? English has a great many 
words that are not phoneEcally regular. Should the teacher tell the child each one and make sure the 
child sees it o\en enough to remember it? That would introduce quite a lot of rote learning to the 
process of beginning reading as well as slow down the process of becoming a reader. 
 
Learners hypothesize, predict, anEcipate, speculate—that is, make educated guesses—all the Eme. It is 
the intellectual leap of an acEve mind, so to speak, and the essence of discovery learning. (See Bruner 
1966, 1990.) Teachers cannot exEnguish guessing even if they wish to do so. As Planck (2022) points out, 
the human brain is a predicEng machine. The key to effecEve teaching is to use educated guessing as a 
posiEve force for opEmizing learning. 
 
With skilled teaching, guessing/hypothesizing, i.e., making a tentaEve response, is an important 
diagnosEc tool. When students encounter the unknown, saying “Try it,” “What is your best guess?” or 
“What do you think it may be?” provides the teacher with important informaEon as to the next 
instrucEonal move. The alternaEve is for the learner to wait passively to be informed of the correct 
response. Furthermore, if there is no informer nearby such as a teacher, parent, older sibling etc., one 
wonders how children will learn on their own. 
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In learning to read, the more informaEon the learner employs, the greater the chance for success. In 
addiEon, once a child has a successful iniEal encounter with a previously unknown word, the greater the 
likelihood that the word will be more easily recognized on a second or third encounter.    
 
Again, we must emphasize that the focus is on educated or informed guessing/hypothesizing. In rare 
instances when a learner habitually guesses wildly, a skilled teacher can modify this behavior quite 
readily.  
 
In the early wriEng process, guessing or hypothesizing is evident as well. When young children begin to 
write, they invent spellings, if they are encouraged to do so. They make educated guesses about how a 
word is spelled. There is strong evidence that allowing young children to make educated guesses about 
the spelling of words results in young children wriEng more and thus facilitates the wriEng process as 
well as helps them become be^er spellers over the long term. (See for example, Cramer, 1978; Beers, 
1995; and Gentry, 1987.) 
 
It seems ironic that scienEsts, if they are good scienEsts, speculate, hypothesize, and make informed or 
educated guesses as a central feature of their work, and yet some seem to think that this behavior in 
young readers and writers should be discouraged.  
 
A Par&ng Word. The late theorist Ken Goodman is o\en reviled today for his characterizaEon of reading 
as, “a psycholinguisEc guessing game” (1967). Perhaps it would have been be^er to have described the 
process as hypothesizing rather than guessing. The use of the word game seems problemaEc as well. 
And perhaps it would have been be^er to have said that reading to a significant degree involves guessing 
or hypothesizing. One may quesEon Goodman’s choice of words, but clearly his research demonstrates 
over and over, with many types of students, from a variety of cultures and at many different reading 
levels, that there is an element of hypothesizing or anEcipaEon in the process of mature reading as well 
as in the process of learning to read. 
 
It is reasonable to note that the reading of texts and even the recogniEon of many individual words 
involves a certain degree of speculaEon, hypothesizing, or guessing. It is a natural human behavior that 
occurs at birth and persists through one’s lifeEme. The quality of our guessing helps determine the 
quality of our learning. Wild guessing can be ineffecEve of course, but thoughLul hypothesizing yields 
rich results. When a teacher asks children to make their best guess, they are asking children to think. To 
deny or discourage educated guessing is to restrict learning. 
 
We return to our original quesEon of what to do about guessing. The answer is that we should 
understand the funcEon of guessing, value it as a vital aspect of learning, and help children learn how to 
use it intelligently.  
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